

Solicitation Response(SR) Dept: 0310 ID: ESR0223210000005789 Ver.: 1 Function: New Phase: Final

Modified by batch , 02/23/2021

Header  1

General Information   Contact   Default Values   Discount   Document Information   Clarification Request

<b>Procurement Folder:</b> 755644	<b>SO Doc Code:</b> ARFQ
<b>Procurement Type:</b> Agency Master Agreement	<b>SO Dept:</b> 0310
<b>Vendor ID:</b> VS0000001326	<b>SO Doc ID:</b> DNR2100000007
<b>Legal Name:</b> KEISLER POLICE SUPPLY INC	<b>Published Date:</b> 2/10/21
<b>Alias/DBA:</b>	<b>Close Date:</b> 2/23/21
<b>Total Bid:</b> \$0.00	<b>Close Time:</b> 13:30
<b>Response Date:</b> 02/23/2021	<b>Status:</b> Closed
<b>Response Time:</b> 9:13	<b>Solicitation Description:</b> Addendum No. 01_Law Enforcement Uniform Open-End
<b>Responded By User ID:</b> VC0000002820	<b>Total of Header Attachments:</b> 1
<b>First Name:</b> Brittany	<b>Total of All Attachments:</b> 1
<b>Last Name:</b> Girdler	
<b>Email:</b> bgirdler@kiesler.com	
<b>Phone:</b> 18122885740	

Item No.	Manufacturer Product No.	Description	Category	Discounted Unit Price Calculation				Bid Total Calculation										
				Catalog Price	Units Provided for Catalog Price	Unit Price	Discount Percentage	Discounted Unit Price	Unit (For Calculation Purposes)	Annual Estimated Qty	Discounted Unit Price	Extended Item Total Cost						
3.1		<b>Apparel &amp; Uniform</b>																
3.1.1	Rain Coat, Bauer 233 R or Equal	Reversible Raincoat	Apparel & Uniform ID															
	<b>Sizes:</b>	<b>Brand Bid</b>	<b>Model Bid</b>															
	Small																	
	Medium																	
	Large																	
	X-Large																	
	2XL																	
	3XL																	
	4XL																	
3.1.2	BDU Embroidered Namestrips	BDU Embroidered Namestrips	Apparel & Uniform ID															
3.1.3	Engraved Nameplates	Engraved Nameplates	Apparel & Uniform ID															
	<b>Colors:</b>																	
	Silver																	
	Brass																	
3.1.4	Damascus Sub Zero Gloves or Equal	Winter Duty Gloves	Apparel & Uniform - ID															
	<b>Sizes:</b>	<b>Brand Bid</b>	<b>Model Bid</b>															
	Small																	
	Medium																	
	Large																	
	X-Large																	
	XX-Large																	
	Men's Propper Summerweight Tactical Shirt-Short Sleeve (F5374/F5376) or Equal	Shirt	Apparel & Uniform - ID															
	<b>Sizes:</b>	<b>Brand Bid</b>	<b>Model Bid</b>															
	X-small																	
	Small																	
	Medium																	
	Large																	
	X-Large																	
	XX-Large																	
	XXX-Large																	
	XXXX-Large																	
3.2		<b>Footwear</b>																
3.2.1	Bates GX8 Gore-Tex, Style# E02268 or Equal	Waterproof Boot	Footwear															
	<b>Sizes:</b>	<b>Brand Bid</b>	<b>Model Bid</b>															
	6																	
	6.5																	
	7																	
	7.5																	

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid



Pricing page Eligible Item Description - All references to brand names are for illustration purposes only and vendors may be the brand listed or an equal product.			Discounted Unit Price Calculation					Bid Total Calculation				
Item No.	Manufacturer Product No.	Description	Category	Catalog Price	Units Provided for Catalog Price	Unit Price	Discount Percentage	Discounted Unit Price	Unit (For Calculation Purposes)	Annual Estimated Qty	Discounted Unit Price	Extended Item Total Cost
3.2.2	8	Bates Lites Buckle, Style# E00083 or Equal Sizes: 6 6.5 7 7.5 8 8.5 9 9.5 10 10.5 11 11.5 12 12.5 13 13.5 14	Footwear	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Each	1	No Bid	No Bid
	8.5											
	9											
	9.5											
	10											
	10.5											
	11											
	11.5											
	12											
	12.5											
	13											
	13.5											
	14											
	3.2.3											
6												
6.5												
7												
7.5												
8												
8.5												
9												
9.5												
10												
10.5												
11												
11.5												
12												
12.5												
13												
13.5												
14												
3.2.3	Bates Chukka, style# E00053 or Equal	Chukka Boots, High Gloss Brand Bid	Footwear	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Each	1	No Bid	No Bid
	6											
	6.5											
	7											
	7.5											
	8											
	8.5											
	9											
	9.5											
	10											
	10.5											
	11											
	11.5											
	12											
12.5												



Pricing page Eligible Item Description - All references to brand names are for illustration purposes only and vendors may be the brand listed or an equal product.				Discounted Unit Price Calculation				Bid Total Calculation						
Item No.	Manufacturer Product No.	Description	Category	Catalog Price	Units Provided for Catalog Price	Unit Price	Discount Percentage	Discounted Unit Price	Unit (For Calculation Purposes)	Annual Estimated Qty	Discounted Unit Price	Extended Item Total Cost		
3.2.4	13	Danner, Acadia Boots, Model 22600, or Equal	Footwear						Each	1				
	13.5								Each	1				
	14									Each	1			
3.2.5		Danner, Lookout 8" Side Zip Boots Model 23824 or equal	Footwear											
3.3		Boston Duty Belt, style# 6504 or Equal	Duty Gear											

NO Bid

NO Bid

NO Bid

NO Bid



Pricing page Eligible Item Description - All references to brand names are for illustration purposes only and vendors may be the brand listed or an equal product.				Discounted Unit Price Calculation				Bid Total Calculation				
Item No.	Manufacturer Product No.	Description	Category	Catalog Price	Units Provided for Catalog Price	Unit Price	Discount Percentage	Discounted Unit Price	Unit (For Calculation Purposes)	Annual Estimated Qty	Discounted Unit Price	Extended Item Total Cost
3.3.1	26	Brand Bid	Model Bid						Each	1		
	28								Each	1		
	30								Each	1		
	32								Each	1		
	34								Each	3		
	36								Each	3		
	38								Each	3		
	40								Each	1		
	42								Each	1		
	44								Each	1		
	46								Each	1		
	48								Each	1		
	50								Each	1		
	52								Each	1		
54						Each	1					
56						Each	1					
58						Each	1					
60						Each	1					
3.3.1	Boston Duty Belt, style# 6504 or Equal	Duty Belt - High Gloss	Duty Gear									
3.3.2		Brand Bid	Model Bid						Each	1		
								Each	1			
									Each	1		
									Each	1		
									Each	3		
									Each	3		
									Each	3		
									Each	1		
									Each	1		
									Each	1		
									Each	1		
									Each	1		
									Each	1		
									Each	1		
3.3.2	Boston Waist Belt, style# 6582 or Equal	Waist/Trouser Belt - Plain Black	Duty Gear									
3.3.2		Brand Bid	Model Bid						Each	1		
								Each	1			
									Each	1		
									Each	1		
									Each	1		

NO BID

BID

BID

NO

NO BID

BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID



Pricing page Eligible Item Description - All references to brand names are for illustration purposes only and vendors may be the brand listed or an equal product.			Discounted Unit Price Calculation				Bid Total Calculation					
Item No.	Manufacturer Product No.	Description	Category	Catalog Price	Units Provided for Catalog Price	Unit Price	Discount Percentage	Discounted Unit Price	Unit (For Calculation Purposes)	Annual Estimated Qty	Discounted Unit Price	Extended Item Total Cost
3.3.2	38	Boston waist belt, style# 6582 or Equal  SIZES: 26 28 30 32 34 36 38 40 42 44 46 48 50 52 54 56 58 60	Duty Gear						Each	1		
	40								Each	1		
	42								Each	1		
	44								Each	1		
	46								Each	1		
	48								Each	1		
	50								Each	1		
	52								Each	1		
	54								Each	1		
	56								Each	1		
	58								Each	1		
	60								Each	1		
	3.3.3				Waist/Trouser Belt - High Gloss	Duty Gear						
		Brand Bid	Model Bid						Each	1		
									Each	1		
									Each	1		
									Each	1		
									Each	1		
									Each	1		
									Each	1		
									Each	1		
									Each	1		
									Each	1		
									Each	1		
3.3.4			Holster, right or left hand	Duty Gear								
		Brand Bid	Model Bid						Each	10		
									Each	1		
3.3.5		Leather pancake holster	Duty Gear									
		Brand Bid	Model Bid						Each	5		
									Each	1		

NO Bid

NO Bid

NO Bid

NO Bid

NO Bid



Pricing page Eligible Item Description - All references to brand names are for illustration purposes only and vendors may be the brand listed or an equal product.			Discounted Unit Price Calculation					Bid Total Calculation				
Item No.	Manufacturer Product No.	Description	Category	Catalog Price	Units Provided for Catalog Price	Unit Price	Discount Percentage	Discounted Unit Price	Unit (For Calculation Purposes)	Annual Estimated Qty	Discounted Unit Price	Extended Item Total Cost
3.3.6	Colors: Plain Black	Brand Bid	Model Bid						Each	3		
	Boston Leather Handcuff Case, Style #5512 or Equal	Handcuff case	Duty Gear									
	Colors: Plain Black High Gloss	Brand Bid	Model Bid						Each	10		
3.3.7	Boston Leather Double Magazine Holder Style #5602 or Equal	Double Magazine Holder	Duty Gear						Each	10		
	Colors: Plain Black High Gloss	Brand Bid	Model Bid						Each	10		
	Zarc International Chemical Spray Holder Model PSH-1303LO with K135 cup or Equal	Aerosol Defense Spray/leather holder	Duty Gear						Each	3		
3.3.8	Colors: Plain Black High Gloss	Brand Bid	Model Bid						Each	3		
	Zarc International Chemical Spray Holder Model PSH-1303LO with K135 cup or Equal	Aerosol Defense Spray/leather holder	Duty Gear						Each	3		
	Colors: Plain Black High Gloss	Brand Bid	Model Bid						Each	3		
3.3.9	Zarc International Inc. High Profile Holster Insert Cup, Model K135 or equal	Aerosol Defense spray Holster	Duty Gear						Each	3		
	Colors: Plain Black High Gloss	Brand Bid	Model Bid						Each	3		
	Boston Leather, Leather Belt Keeper, Model 5456, or equal	Belt Keeper	Duty Gear						Each	1		
3.3.10	Colors: Plain Black High Gloss	Brand Bid	Model Bid						Each	1		
	Boston Leather, Leather Belt Keeper, Model 5456, or equal	Belt Keeper	Duty Gear						Each	1		
	Colors: Plain Black High Gloss	Brand Bid	Model Bid						Each	1		
3.3.11	Boston Leather Leather Duty Belt Flashlight Holster, Model 5559PPS, or Equal	Leather Flashlight Holder	Duty Gear						Each	40		
	Colors: Black	Brand Bid	Model Bid						Each	40		
	Molrola, Leather Radio Carry Case, Model PMLN 5657B, or Equal	Leather Radio Carry Case	Duty Gear						Each	10		
3.3.12	Colors: Black	Brand Bid	Model Bid						Each	10		
	Molrola, Leather Radio Carry Case, Model PMLN 5657B, or Equal	Leather Radio Carry Case	Duty Gear						Each	10		
	Colors: Black	Brand Bid	Model Bid						Each	10		



Pricing page Eligible Item Description - All references to brand names are for illustration purposes only and vendors may be the brand listed or an equal product.				Discounted Unit Price Calculation					Bid Total Calculation			
Item No.	Manufacturer Product No.	Description	Category	Catalog Price	Units Provided for Catalog Price	Unit Price	Discount Percentage	Discounted Unit Price	Unit (For Calculation Purposes)	Annual Estimated Qty	Discounted Unit Price	Extended Item Total Cost
3.3.13	Black	Brand Bid	Model Bid						Each	5		
	Strong Leather Company, Leather Clip on Badge Holder with Chain, Model 71227, or Equal	Badge Holder	Duty Gear									
	Colors:											
3.3.14	Black	Brand Bid	Model Bid						Each	2		
	Boston Leather Sam Browne Shoulder Strap, Model 6511, or Equal	Shoulder Strap	Duty Gear									
	Colors:											
3.3.15	Black	Brand Bid	Model Bid						Each	2		
	Bianchi, Accumold Nylon Duty Belt, Model 7200, or equal	Duty Belt	Duty Gear									
	Colors:											
3.3.16	Black	Brand Bid	Model Bid						Each	5		
	Safariland, Glock 21 Gen 4 Holster, Model 6280-383-261, or equal	Holster	Duty Gear									
	Colors:											
3.3.17	Black	Brand Bid	Model Bid						Each	5		
	Bianchi, Accumold, Double Cluff Case, Model 7317, or Equal	Holster	Duty Gear									
	Colors:											
3.3.18	Black	Brand Bid	Model Bid						Each	5		
	Bianchi, Accumold Double Magazine Pouch, Model 7302, or Equal	Holster	Duty Gear									
	Colors:											
	Black	Brand Bid	Model Bid						Each	5		



Pricing page Eligible Item Description - All references to brand names are for illustration purposes only and vendors may be the brand listed or an equal product.				Discounted Unit Price Calculation					Bid Total Calculation			
Item No.	Manufacturer Product No.	Description	Category	Catalog Price	Units Provided for Catalog Price	Unit Price	Discount Percentage	Discounted Unit Price	Unit (For Calculation Purposes)	Annual Estimated Qty	Discounted Unit Price	Extended Item Total Cost
3.3.19	Zarc International, Inc. Nylon Defense Spray Holder, Model PSH-5731.2, or Equal	Holster	Duty Gear									
	<b>Colors:</b>											
	Black	Brand Bid	Model Bid						Each	2		
3.3.20	Blanchi Nylon Belt Keepers, Model 7406, or Equal	Belt	Duty Gear									
	<b>Colors:</b>											
	Black	Brand Bid	Model Bid						Each	2		
3.3.21	Boston Leather, Nylon Duty Belt Flashlight holster, Model 5559PS-5, Or equal	Holster	Duty Gear									
	<b>Colors:</b>											
	Black	Brand Bid	Model Bid						Each	2		
3.3.22	Blanchi, Accumold Universal Radio Holder, Model 7314S, or Equal	Holster	Duty Gear									
	<b>Colors:</b>											
	Black	Brand Bid	Model Bid						Each	2		









Pricing page Eligible Item Description - All references to brand names are for illustration purposes only and vendors may be the brand listed or an equal product.				Discounted Unit Price Calculation					Bid Total Calculation			
Item No.	Manufacturer Product No.	Description	Category	Catalog Price	Units Provided for Catalog Price	Unit Price	Discount Percentage	Discounted Unit Price	Unit (For Calculation Purposes)	Annual Estimated Qty	Discounted Unit Price	Extended Item Total Cost
3.8		Less Lethal										
3.8.1	Fox Labs International, Model# 22-TrigM or Equal	Aerosol Defense Spray	Less Lethal						Each	19		
		Brand Bid	Model Bid									
Total Bid Amount:											\$0.00	

Failure to use this form may result in disqualification  
 \* Estimated quantities are for bidding purposes only. More or less may be utilized by the Agency.  
 \* All prices include delivery



Pricing page Eligible Item Description - All references to brand names are for illustration purposes only and vendors may be the brand listed or an equal product.			Discounted Unit Price Calculation					Bid Total Calculation				
Item No.	Manufacturer Product No.	Description	Category	Catalog Price	Units Provided for Catalog Price	Unit Price	Discount Percentage	Discounted Unit Price	Unit (For Calculation Purposes)	Annual Estimated Unit Qty	Discounted Unit Price	Extended Item Total Cost
List of Discount Percentages:												
			Category				DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE					
3.1		Apparel & Uniform ID										
3.2		Footwear										
3.3		Duty Gear										
3.4		Handcuff/Restraints										
3.5		Miscellaneous										
3.6-3.7		Tactical Equipment										
3.8		Less Lethal										
Bidder/Vendor Information: Name: <u>Kiesler Police Supply Inc</u> Address: <u>2802 Sabak Mill Road</u> <u>324 Personville, IN 47150</u> Phone No: <u>812-284-5740</u> Fax No: <u>812-284-8088</u> Email Address: <u>bgindler@kiesler.com</u> Authorized Signature: <u>Bradley A. L. Indler</u>												



STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA  
**PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT**

**CONSTRUCTION CONTRACTS:** Under W. Va. Code § 5-22-1(i), the contracting public entity shall not award a construction contract to any bidder that is known to be in default on any monetary obligation owed to the state or a political subdivision of the state, including, but not limited to, obligations related to payroll taxes, property taxes, sales and use taxes, fire service fees, or other fines or fees.

**ALL CONTRACTS:** Under W. Va. Code §15A-3-14, no contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related party to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and: (1) the debt owed is an amount greater than one thousand dollars in the aggregate; or (2) the debtor is in employer default.

**EXCEPTION:** The prohibition listed above does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to chapter eleven of the W. Va. Code, workers' compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment and the matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not in default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

**DEFINITIONS:**

**"Debt"** means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any of its political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted workers' compensation premium, penalty or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be paid to the state or any of its political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued thereon.

**"Employer default"** means having an outstanding balance or liability to the old fund or to the uninsured employers' fund or being in policy default, as defined in W. Va. Code § 23-2c-2, failure to maintain mandatory workers' compensation coverage, or failure to fully meet its obligations as a workers' compensation self-insured employer. An employer is not in employer default if it has entered into a repayment agreement with the Insurance Commissioner and remains in compliance with the obligations under the repayment agreement

**"Related party"** means a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited liability company or any other form or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage, ownership or contract through which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that the party will actually or by effect receive or control a portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets or exceeds five percent of the total contract amount.

**AFFIRMATION:** By signing this form, the vendor's authorized signer affirms and acknowledges under penalty of law for false swearing (W. Va. Code §61-5-3) that: (1) for construction contracts, the vendor is not in default on any monetary obligation owed to the state or a political subdivision of the state, and (2) for all other contracts, that neither vendor nor any related party owe a debt as defined above and that neither vendor nor any related party are in employer default as defined above, unless the debt or employer default is permitted under the exception above.

**WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE:**

Vendor's Name: Kiesler Police Supply, Inc.

Authorized Signature: Brittany A.L. Girdler Date: 2/19/2021

State of Indiana

County of Clark, to-wit:

Taken, subscribed, and sworn to before me this 19 day of February, 2021.

My Commission expires October 19, 2028.

AFFIX SEAL HERE

NOTARY PUBLIC Christina Ferguson

